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Leader of Iran's Islamic Revolution 
Ayatollah Seyyed Ali Khamenei 
addresses seminary students in 
Tehran on Wednesday, July 12, 2023.
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US shifted 
from direct to 
proxy attacks: 
IRGC chief

PRESS TV –  The chief com-
mander of the Islamic Rev-
olution Guards Corps (IRGC) 
hailed Iran’s formidable 
defensive power, noting 
that the US is resorting to 
waging proxy attacks on 
Iran since they are well 
aware that direct military 
action would spell a “major 
suicide”. 
Major General Hossein Sa-
lami underlined that even 
though Iran is currently 
among the world’s top five 
powers in manufacturing 
unmanned aerial vehicles, 
Iran’s deterrent power is not 
limited to just missiles and 
drones.

Kuwait 
extradites 
11 Iranian 
prisoners
IRNA – Eleven Iranian pris-
oners have been extradited 
from Kuwait and handed 
over to the Iranian judicial 
authorities late on Tuesday 
as part of an extradition 
treaty with the Arab country.
Iran and Kuwait have also 
agreed, as part of a joint 
consular committee held 
recently between the two 
neighboring countries, to 
cooperate on judicial issues.

Leader of Iran's Islam-
ic Revolution Ayatollah 
Seyyed Ali Khamenei says 
the country is in confron-
tation with a “lying front” 
that brands itself as a “lib-
eral democracy”, though 
it’s neither liberal nor 
democrat.
Addressing seminary 
students in Tehran on 
Wednesday, the Leader 
said Iran is in the midst of 
a “civilizational and global” 
fight with “lying” arrogant 
powers hiding behind the 
labels of liberalism and 
democracy, Press TV re-
ported.
He emphasized that this 
front, which opposes the 
Iranian nation, stands 
against the pursuit of free-
dom, independent think-
ing, and any form of de-
mocracy not subservient 
to global arrogance.
Ayatollah Khamenei ques-
tioned the sincerity of 
those Western countries 
that claim to be liberal 
while having a history of 
colonization. He highlight-

ed the example of India, 
which was colonized for 
over a hundred years, re-
sulting in the exploitation 
of its resources and the im-
poverishment of its people.
“If you’re liberal, why did 
you colonize [countries]? … 
What kind of a liberal you 
are, what a kind of free-
dom-seeker you are, and 
what kind of a free-thinker 
you are when you colonize 
a multi-million nation like 
India for over a hundred 
years and keep it under 
your control?”
The Leader further main-
tained the ongoing conflict 
in Ukraine and criticized 
the West’s tendency to col-
onize nations and exploit 
their resources.
“The Ukrainian people 
are left to be killed since 
the interests of the West-
ern companies that pro-
duce and sell arms lie in 
prolonging the war in 
Ukraine,” he said.
Ayatollah Khamenei also 
questioned the arrogant 
Western powers’ support 

for democracy, saying 
their claim is not genuine 
and real. 
“They’re not even dem-
ocrats. They lie as they 
impose governments [on 
nations] in some places. 

They’re not after democ-
racy and they’re one hun-
dred percent opposed to a 
democracy that is not serv-
ing them,” he said.
Stressing that the West is 
now more vulnerable than 

ever, Ayatollah Khamenei 
said the US is now in con-
frontation with its own 
people and other nations 
and embodies many acts 
of evil including racism and 
cruelty.

Liberal democrat 
powers are neither: 
Leader

Iran media 
report on 
Malley elicits 
US reaction

 International Desk

A report published by the 
Iranian newspaper Tehran 
Times, which claimed Rob-
ert Malley’s security clear-
ance suspension started on 
April 21, was met with the 
reaction of US politicians.
US State Department 
spokesman Matthew Mill-
er said that he cannot con-
firm Malley was asked to 
go on leave on April 21. 
Senator Josh Hawley crit-
icized the US government 
for not being forthcoming 
and allowing an Iranian 
newspaper to access and 
publish the information.
“I feel like I’ve been lied 
to. They (the administra-
tion) lie to us all the time 
on various issues including 
Afghanistan, Iraq, Iran, and 
China. It’s a pattern in this 
administration,” he added.

NEWS IN BRIEF 

 International Desk

PERSPECTIVE
A final statement of the 
sixth joint meeting be-
tween the foreign ministers 
of the member countries 
of the Persian Gulf Coop-
eration Council and Russia 
sparked widespread reac-
tions from Iran, sending a 
strong message that Iran 
never stands on ceremony 
with anyone over its ter-
ritorial integrity and that 
any encroachment upon 
its land is considered a vi-
olation of its red lines. 
One section of the joint 
statement, issued by the 
Russian foreign minister 
and his Arab counterparts, 
expressed support for the 
United Arab Emirates’ en-
deavors to find a peaceful 
resolution to the dispute 
concerning the three is-
lands of Lesser Tunb, 
Greater Tunb, and Abu 
Musa. The suggested ap-
proaches to resolving the 
issue included bilateral di-
alogue or seeking interven-
tion from the International 
Court of Justice, based on 
international law and the 
principles outlined in the 
United Nations Charter.
Nevertheless, this specific 
segment of the statement 
drew swift and critical re-
actions within Iran. Both 
the general public on social 
media platforms and the 
media outlets, as well as 
the Ministry of Foreign Af-
fairs and lawmakers came 

out against it. The underly-
ing theme in these critical 
responses was a reminder 
that historical records es-
tablish the three islands 
as an inseparable part of 
Iran’s territory.
The inclusion of Russia’s 
signature on the conten-
tious statement carries 
significant implications. 
While the UAE and the 
council’s member states 
have persistently advocat-
ed for their non-historical 
claims, Russia’s unexpect-
ed support, which count-
ers Iran’s national inter-
ests, demands attention.
Simultaneously, the polit-
ical ties between Tehran 
and Moscow have reached 
an unprecedented level, 
fostering extensive col-
laboration across various 
realms, including politics, 
economy, and security. 
The intricate nature of 
Tehran-Moscow relations 
may have led to suspicions, 
both domestically and in-
ternationally, that the Ira-
nian government would 
refrain from expressing a 
specific critical reaction to-
ward Moscow’s alignment 
with positions detrimental 
to Iran.
However, reality turned 
out to be different. Yester-
day morning, the Russian 
ambassador in Tehran was 
summoned to the Ministry 
of Foreign Affairs, where 
Iran effectively conveyed 
its objections to the con-
tents of the aforemen-
tioned statement.

During a meeting with the 
Russian ambassador, Ali-
reza Enayati, an assistant 
minister and the director 
general of the Persian Gulf 
at the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs, underscored the 
enduring ownership of 
the three Iranian islands 
as integral parts of Iranian 
territory. Enayati demand-
ed that Russia rectify its 
stance on this matter. 
In response, the Russian 
ambassador in Tehran 
assured Enayati of his 
country’s commitment to 
upholding Iran’s territori-
al integrity and pledged to 
promptly relay the issue to 
Moscow for further consid-
eration.
Foreign Minister Hossein 
Amir-Abdollahian con-
veyed a critical reaction to 
the same matter through a 
tweet, affirming that Iran 
“does not stand on ceremo-
ny with any party over its 
independence, sovereignty 
and territorial integrity”.
Iranian government spokes-
man Ali Bahadori also 

tweeted that the Islamic 
Republic would not com-
promise with anyone over 
its national interests and 
sovereignty.
Several members of the 
Iranian Parliament also 
denounced the joint state-
ment through interviews 
with media and on their 
personal social media ac-
counts. Among them, Vahid 
Jalalzadeh, the head of the 
Parliament’s National Se-
curity and Foreign Policy 
Committee, took to Twitter 
and wrote, “To our friends 
in Russia, we have a clear 
stance on the unsubstanti-
ated and threadbare claims 
of the Emiratis regarding 
the Iranian islands. How-
ever, Moscow’s stance 
against Iran is detrimental 
to the bilateral relation-
ship. Iran’s support for 
Moscow is conditional.”
Nezamoddin Mousavi, the 
spokesperson for the Par-
liament’s Presiding Board, 
added his voice to the dis-
cussion, asserting, “Lesser 
Tunb, Greater Tunb, and 

Abu Musa islands are inte-
gral and everlasting parts 
of Iran’s territory. It is cru-
cial for all governments, 
including the Russian gov-
ernment, to understand 
that the Iranian govern-
ment and its people have 
no disputes concerning 
these three islands. They 
will not tolerate any insin-
uations or unwarranted 
claims.”
In a previous incident 
where the Chinese govern-
ment had joined the mem-
bers of the Persian Gulf 
Cooperation Council in a 
similar statement, the Chi-
nese ambassador in Teh-
ran was also summoned 
to the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs, and Iran officially 
registered its protest with 
the Chinese government.
Iran has consistently em-
phasized its commitment 
to good neighborly rela-
tions and the promotion 
of regional cooperation 
among neighboring coun-
tries. In line with this 
approach, Iran recently 
achieved a diplomatic 
breakthrough by normaliz-
ing its relations with Saudi 
Arabia after a seven-year 
hiatus, following multiple 
rounds of talks. Concur-
rently, Iran has deepened 
its collaborations with 
Russia and China, both of 
which share Iran’s support 
for multilateralism and op-
position to unilateral dom-
inance within the interna-
tional system. However, 
these partnerships are 

firmly rooted in the princi-
ple of respecting territorial 
integrity.
Throughout its extensive 
history, the Iranian peo-
ple have remained vigilant 
against any encroachment 
or infringement upon their 
land. This sentiment holds 
true even in the past four 
decades. A prime example 
of Iranian patriotism was 
demonstrated during the 
eight-year defense against 
the aggression of the for-
mer Iraqi regime.
Hence, it is essential to 
dispel any misconceptions 
that the regional de-es-
calation process initiated 
by Iran, the normalization 
of relations with Saudi 
Arabia, or the positive re-
lationships fostered with 
Russia and China indicate 
a renouncement of Iran’s 
territorial integrity or a 
departure from countering 
anti-Iranian claims. 
Responding to the joint 
statement, the Iranian For-
eign Ministry’s spokesper-
son stated, “These islands 
unequivocally belong to 
Iran, and such statements 
run counter to the friendly 
relations between Iran and 
its neighboring countries.” 
Moreover, Nasser Kanaani 
reiterated that “Iran, while 
emphasizing the contin-
uation of a policy of good 
neighborliness and mutual 
respect, views the develop-
ment and stability of the 
region as a shared respon-
sibility among regional 
nations.”

Russian envoy summoned over isles
Iran never stands on ceremony with anyone


