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Iran’s First Vice President 
Mohammad Mokhber will 
visit China to participate in 
the opening ceremony of 
the 6th China International 
Import Exhibition (CIIE), as 
he will negotiate with the 
officials of China and the 
countries present at the 

event on the development 
of the international mar-
kets of Iran.
Announcing the above, 
Mohammad Jamshidi, the 
Iranian president’s deputy 
chief of staff for political 
affairs added that the 6th 
CIIE will officially open on 
Sunday, with the presence 
of Chinese Prime Minis-

ter Li Qiang, as well as 
high-ranking officials from 
other countries, fvpresi-
dent.ir wrote. 
At the official invitation 
of the Chinese premier, 
Mokhber departed Teh-
ran for Shanghai to speak 
at the opening ceremony 
of the event, as he will 
conduct bilateral and 

multilateral talks for the 
development of economic 
relations and finding new 
markets for Iranian goods 
in China and other coun-
tries.
Referring to China’s great 
market, Jamshidi noted 
that the presence of other 
countries in the exhibition 
is a very good opportunity 

for Iran to find new mar-
kets for Iranian goods and 
increase the export capac-
ity of the country.
Also, with the presence of 
other high-ranking offi-
cials, Mokhber will inau-
gurate the pavilion of the 
Islamic Republic of Iran in 
the Shanghai exhibition.
The visit of traders and of-

ficials from other countries 
to Iran’s pavilion will be a 
good opportunity to intro-
duce Iran’s economic capa-
bilities, Jamshidi stated.
Over 50 companies as 
well as 250 Iranian busi-
nesspersons in different 
economic and commercial 
sectors will showcase their 
products at the exhibition.

China International Im-
port Expo (CIIE) is a trade 
fair that has been held in 
Shanghai, China every year 
since 2018. The event is the 
first expo in the world at 
the national level with the 
subject of imports.
Various exhibitors from 
d i f fe re n t  b u s i n e s s e s 
and countries as well as 
“Hongqiao International 
Economic Forum” are par-
ticipating in the expo. The 
formation of the China In-
ternational Import Expo 
was personally proposed, 
promoted and directed by 
the current Chinese Presi-
dent Xi Jinping.
The exhibition is jointly 
organized by the Ministry 
of Commerce of China and 
the Shanghai Municipal 
People’s Government. The 
partners of the CIIE in-
clude the World Trade Or-
ganization, the United Na-
tions Conference on Trade 
and Development, and the 
United Nations Industrial 

Development Organization.
The purpose of the CIIE is 
to introduce China’s do-
mestic market to foreign 
companies and strengthen 
domestic consumption. 
The exhibition has pro-
vided a platform for the 
cooperation of rich and 
poor countries as well as 
small and large economies 
in the form of win-win co-
operation. It also allows 
companies and experts to 
talk closely to find their 
business partners.

China’s open-door 
policy
Reviewing the past five 
editions of the CIIE, “open 
doors” and “sharing oppor-
tunities” have always been 
the keywords in the five 
inaugural speeches of Chi-
nese leader Xi Jinping.
Xi Jinping has repeatedly 
emphasized that not only 
will China’s doors not be 
closed, but they will be-
come more open day by 
day. China will always pro-
vide a positive and stable 
driving force for the growth 
of the world economy, and 
will always be a large and 
dynamic market for coun-
tries looking for business 
opportunities. Parts of the 
Chinese president’s speech 
last year are as follows:
•Opening up is an import-
ant driving force for the 
progress of human civili-
zation and the only way for 
global prosperity and de-
velopment. Currently, the 
world is undergoing major 
changes not seen in a cen-
tury and the global econ-
omy lacks the momentum 
to recover. We should use 
openness to solve develop-

ment problems, use open-
ness to bring together the 
power of cooperation, use 
openness to gather inno-
vation momentum, and use 
openness to seek common 
interests. This action will 
benefit development re-
sults. It makes the people 
of all countries fairer.
•China will encourage all 
countries to share opportu-
nities for deepening inter-
national cooperation, par-
ticipate fully and deeply in 
WTO reform negotiations, 
promote trade and invest-
ment liberalization and 
facilitation, and promote 
international macroeco-
nomic policy coordination. 
, will jointly create a new 
impetus for global develop-
ment, and will actively join 
the Comprehensive and 
Progressive Agreement for 
Trans-Pacific Partnership 
and the Digital Economy 
Partnership Agreement, 
expand the global network 
of high-standard free trade 
zones. It will strongly sup-
port and assist developing 
countries to accelerate 
their development and 
promote the construction 
of a society with a common 
future for mankind.
•China is willing to work 
with other countries to 
practice true multilater-
alism, build greater con-
sensus on opening up, and 
overcome the difficulties 
and challenges facing glob-
al economic development 
and the opening brings a 
new bright future for global 
development.

Introduction of CIIE 
2023
The first edition of the expo 

was opened by President Xi 
Jinping in 2018. The 2019 
Expo was also opened by Xi 
Jinping, while French Pres-
ident Emmanuel Macron 
was one of the honored 
visitors of the expo.
The fifth edition of the CIIE 
was held in 2022, with 
more than 2,800 booths 
and 100 countries as the 
turnover of the exhibition 
days last year was $73.6 
billion.
This year, the sixth edition 
(CIIE 2023) will be held in 
Shanghai on November 
5-10. The exhibition con-
sists of four sections, in-
cluding national pavilions, 
commercial pavilions, in-
ternational economy sec-
tion and activities related 
to cultural exchange.
Guests from 145 countries 
and international organi-
zations will participate in 
the event. More than 3,400 
exhibitors and 394,000 
professional visitors have 
registered to attend the 
exhibition, which shows 
a complete return to the 
pre-coronavirus level. Hun-
dreds of executives from 
Fortune 500 companies are 
expected to attend the CIIE, 
which shows an increase 

compared to previous 
years. A total of 15 major 
brands of the automotive 
industry, 10 major indus-
trial power companies, 10 
medical equipment man-
ufacturers, three mining 
giants, four top grain trad-
ing companies and five top 
shipping companies have 
confirmed their presence 
in the exhibition.
The CIIE will be active in 
six major areas, including 
the following: Medical and 
health care equipment, 
food and agricultural prod-
ucts, smart industries and 
information technology, 
consumer goods, business 
services and automobiles.

Iran’s pavilion at CIIE 
2023 
The Iran-China Trade Cen-
ter is responsible for hold-
ing the Iran Pavilion at the 
CIIE 2023. The pavilion 
offers Iranian products to 
buyers in the following four 
areas: food products, smart 
industries and information 
technology, medical equip-
ment and consumer goods.
The invitation to partici-
pate in the exhibition was 
published by the Iran-Chi-
na Trade Center in April, 

and the companies apply-
ing to participate in CIIE 
sent their documents to the 
center. A conference as well 
as press meetings were 
held by the center to better 
explain the opportunities in 
the CIIE. Iran’s trade pavil-
ion in China is expected to 
provide opportunities for 
companies.
Officially invited by the Chi-
nese prime minister, Iran’s 
First Vice President Mo-
hammad Mokhber will par-
ticipate and give a speech 
at the opening ceremony of 
the exhibition. 
High-ranking officials of 
some other countries, in-
cluding Germany, Australia 
and Cuba will be also pres-
ent and deliver speeches at 
the opening ceremony. 
The opening of CIIE 2023 
will be held in the presence 
of the Chinese Prime Min-
ister Li Qiang, and then all 
the officials will attend the 
national pavilions of the 
invited countries and inau-
gurate them.
The presence of Iran’s first 
vice president in the great 
even is a new opportuni-
ty for the development of 
Iran’s international mar-
kets.

Iran imports 
basic goods 
worth over 
$9b: IRICA
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Official statistics released 
by the Islamic Republic of 
Iran Customs Administra-
tion (IRICA) indicate that 
in the first seven months 
of the current Iranian cal-
endar year (started March 
21), over 13 million tons 
of essential commodities 
of 20 different types were 
imported into the country, 
worth $9.163 billion.
The imports of basic goods 
have experienced a 0.98% 
increase in terms of weight 
and a 4.97% decrease in 
terms of value compared to 
the same period last year, 
according to ISNA.
Corn, semi-solid and liquid 
edible oils, various types of 
oilseeds, rice, wheat, barley, 
chemical fertilizers, heavy 
rubber, soybean meal, raw 
sugar, printing and writing 
paper, paper pulp, dry tea, 
legumes, red meat, chemi-
cal technical poisons, chick-
en meat, various seeds, and 
newspaper paper were 
among the 20 essential 
commodities imported to 
the country.
Corn has secured the top 
position among essential 
imported commodities ex-
ceeding 4.9 million tons, 
worth more than $2 billion. 
Semi-solid and liquid edible 
oils rank second, with over 
1.1 million tons imported, 
valued at $1.8 billion.
Red meat, chemical fer-
tilizers, and barley have 
the highest increases in 
imports among the essen-
tial commodities while the 
imports of chicken meat, 
dry tea, raw sugar, and rice 
have decreased by 62% 
compared to the first seven 
months of the previous Ira-
nian calendar year.
Figures by the IRICA show 
the country's foreign trade 
reached $64.4 billion in the 
seven months to October 22 
with a deficit of $7.7 billion.
Iran exported 79.5 million 
tons of non-oil commod-
ities worth $28.3 billion 
from March 21 to October 
22, IRICA head Mohammad 
Rezvani-Far said last week.

China opens doors for imports by holding CIIE

VP Mokhber to attend 
opening ceremony of China 
International Import Expo


