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A faculty member of the 
University of Art in Shiraz, 
who oversees the archae-
ological team at the Shah 
Cheragh Metro Station, be-
lieves that the first archae-
ological excavation of the 
historical fabric of Shiraz, 
initiated for scientific in-
vestigations related to the 
development of the urban 
railway, represents a gold-
en opportunity for archae-
ological research, alongside 
its practical applications.
Meysam Nikzad stated 
that, until now, purposeful 
archaeological excavations 
have not been conducted 
in the historical fabric of 
Shiraz, resulting in limited 
information regarding the 
historical sequence and ar-
chaeological layers within 
this metropolis.
He added that, considering 
this rare opportunity, the ar-
chaeological team stationed 
at the site comprises a mix 
of researchers and special-
ists, leveraging the research 
capabilities of the faculty 
members from the Univer-
sity of Art, particularly in ar-
chitecture and restoration, 
to analyze the findings of 
the excavation, IRNA wrote.
Nikzad continued by not-
ing that this project began 
in April of this year as part 
of a trilateral agreement 
between the University of 
Art in Shiraz, the Trans-
portation and Traffic De-
partment of Shiraz Munic-
ipality, and the Research 
Institute of Cultural Heri-
tage, with the Fars Cultur-
al Heritage Department 
supervising the operations.

He mentioned that the 
excavation’s depth has 
reached nearly two me-
ters; however, the layers 
unearthed remain disor-
dered and chaotic due to 
being intermixed with con-
temporary waste, such as 
plastic fragments and other 
modern refuse.
Nikzad added that current-
ly, excavations are under-

way in four trenches, where 
remnants of residential 
architecture from the Sec-
ond Pahlavi era have been 
uncovered. These remains 
are part of a residential 
unit designed with a cen-
tral courtyard, which, in the 
excavated trenches, have 
revealed a kitchen, storage 
area, courtyard, and sec-
tions of the living space.

The head of the archae-
ological team explained 
that the materials used 
in this building included 
brick and clay mortar, with 
some areas coated in gyp-
sum or lime mortar. These 
materials continued to be 
utilized during the 1960s 
and 1970s, alongside alter-
ations and additions such 
as cementing the courtyard 

floor, before the site was 
demolished and leveled for 
the construction of a park-
ing area.
He noted that among the 
movable findings, there are 
simple and glazed pottery 
fragments that date back 
to the later Islamic period.
The Chancellor of the Uni-
versity of Art in Shiraz em-
phasized the university’s 

role in relation to industry 
and society. He stated that 
last year, agreements were 
established between the 
Transportation and Traffic 
Department of Shiraz Mu-
nicipality, the Research In-
stitute of Cultural Heritage, 
and the University of Art in 
Shiraz, designating the uni-
versity as a research arm 
for the municipality and 

the research institute con-
cerning the Shiraz metro 
project.
Sattar  Khaledian ex-
pressed that what was 
paramount in this context, 
and what all parties un-
derscored, was the need 
for the preservation and 
respect for historical and 
cultural heritage.
He added that the Universi-
ty of Art in Shiraz remains 
committed to upholding sci-
entific, professional, and re-
search ethics. Following the 
acquisition of the necessary 
permits from the Research 
Institute of Cultural Heri-
tage, the faculty members 
have conducted their exca-
vations in accordance with 
international standards, 
ensuring the provision of 
adequate space for precise 
and specialized reporting 
and visits by journalists 
and media representatives 
to inform the esteemed cit-
izens of Shiraz and fellow 
countrymen.
He mentioned that the 
faculty members of this 
institution have previously 
engaged in archaeologi-
cal excavations at historic 
sites, including Poshtchi 
Hill, the Abou Nasr Palace, 
and Persepolis, thereby 
shedding valuable light on 
the history of this city and 
province.
Khaledian noted that the 
trust the people of Shiraz 
place in the University of 
Art, along with citizens’ re-
quests for the university’s 
continued involvement in 
archaeological, historical, 
and cultural studies, has 
underscored the pressing 
necessity of this project.

Archaeologists examine excavated 
artifacts from historical Shiraz
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Elegance of Gelich; an ancient art form of Semnan Province
In the rich tapestry of 
Iran’s cultural heritage, 
Gelich Bafi stands out as 
a significant traditional 
craft, particularly in the 
Semnan province. This 
ancient art form reflects 
the creativity and crafts-
manship of local artisans 
who have passed down 
techniques through gener-
ations. Gelich, resembling 
Kilim rugs, showcases 

unique patterns and vi-
brant colors that enhance 
the beauty of any space. It 
not only serves aesthetic 
purposes but also plays a 
practical role in daily life, 
making it a cherished part 
of Iranian culture.
One of the applied handi-
crafts of Semnan is Gelich 
Bafi.  Like many other 
handwoven crafts of Iran, 
Gelich is very ancient, and 

since it resembles Kilim, 
it is locally named Gelich. 
The warps of Gelich are 
made from cotton yarn, 
while colorful wool yarns 
are used for the wefts, vis-
itiran.ir wrote.
The tools used to create 
Gelich are similar to those 
of textile machinery, but 
the final product resem-
bles Kilim. Because Gelich 
is often produced using 

machinery, the production 
rate is higher, making it 
more financially efficient. 
The method of weaving 
Gelich is akin to that of 
making fabrics; however, 
spun cotton yarns with a 
high level of twist are uti-
lized as warps. Colorful 
wool yarns are threaded 
as wefts, creating beautiful 
geometric motifs in various 
colors. Gelich can be made 

in sizes suitable for prayer 
rugs, ground cloths, and 
doormats.
Gelich is versatile and can 
be used to create various 
items such as Sar Hamou-
mi — a bag for bath tools 
used in public bathhouses 
— Ayeneh Kiseh, mean-
ing “mirror bag,” which is 
a small sachet for makeup 
accessories or sewing sup-
plies; Asb Sari, a large piece 

of Gelich placed on horses 
during weddings to en-
hance the dowry’s appear-
ance; Kaj Sari, a sachet that 
historically held utensils 
but is now filled with fibers 
for cushions; and Korsi Sari, 
the cover of a Korsi (a low ta-
ble with a heater underneath) that 
beautifies the setting.
Gelich features many fa-
mous patterns and key cen-
ters for producing the beau-

tiful handwoven products 
include the northern cities 
and villages of Semnan.
To preserve Gelich, it is es-
sential to protect it from 
moths, humidity, flames, 
direct sunlight, chemi-
cal bleachers, and sharp 
objects. Cleaning Gelich 
is simple, requiring only 
soap and lukewarm water 
to maintain its beauty and 
longevity.
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